
Contractor Name *

Contract Description

1a. The Contract Meets at
least on of the following:
Board has determined
there is insufficient
number of providers in the
area:

Select an answer

1b. The Contract Meets at
least on of the following:
Board has determined
there is a training service
provider of demonstrated
effectiveness offered by
CBOs or private entities to
serve populations with
multiple barriers

Select an answer

1c. The Contract Meets at
least on of the following:
The Board determined that
the most appropriate
training could be provided
by an institution of higher
education or other
provider of training
services to train multiple

Select an answer
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individuals for jobs in in-
demand sectors or
occupations.

1d. The Contract Meets at
least on of the following:
The Board considered
entering into a pay-for-
performance contract to
provide training services
and ensured that the
contract is consistent with
the WIOA Final Rule at 20
CFR 683.510.

Select an answer

2. There is documentation
for each contract
supporting at least the
organization is financially
stable.

Select an answer

3a. There is documentation
showing that the
contractor has
demonstrated
performance to hard to
serve populations through
the following: Placement
rate

Select an answer

3b. There is
documentation showing
that the contractor has
demonstrated
performance to hard to
serve populations through
the following: Skill
attainment

Select an answer
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3c. There is documentation
showing that the
contractor has
demonstrated
performance to hard to
serve populations through
the following: Certificates
awarded

Select an answer

3d. There is
documentation showing
that the contractor has
demonstrated
performance to hard to
serve populations through
the following: Program
completion rate

Select an answer

3e. There is documentation
showing that the
contractor has
demonstrated
performance to hard to
serve populations through
the following: Employment
retention

Select an answer

Notes
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